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A rabbi reveals the profound astrological tradition to be found in the Kabbalah, Bible, Talmud, and Midrash.

• A thorough explanation of the most sophisticated system of astrology known.

• More than 30 tables and charts for doing readings and creating horoscopes.

• New edition of Astrological Secrets of the Hebrew Sages.

The ancient Hebrews developed the richest and most sophisticated system of astrology known in the Western
world, but this practice has been almost completely forgotten. Now Joel Dobin, an ordained rabbi and
practicing astrologer, brings to light the wealth of astrological information in the Kabbalah, Bible, Talmud,
and Midrash, revealing a profound tradition as valuable today as it was millennia ago. Key to this
astrological system is the Kabbalah--the Jewish mystery tradition--in which the sacred Tree of Life links the
influences of the twelve zodiacal constellations and seven planets to specific letters of the Hebrew alphabet,
creating a unique method for constructing horoscopes. Analyses of the zodiac according to the rulerships of
the sons of Jacob, the importance of solar and lunar directions and masculine and feminine influences, and
the paradigm-shifting nature of the Jupiter-Saturn conjunction (next scheduled for 2001) are all explored for
their impact on global and personal destiny. More than 30 tables and charts put all the information needed for
doing astrological readings at your fingertips.
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From reader reviews:

Kristen Zamora:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important usually. The book Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages
has been making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The reserve Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages is not
only giving you much more new information but also being your friend when you experience bored. You can
spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship together with the book
Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages. You never truly feel lose out for
everything should you read some books.

Miriam Ellis:

Beside this kind of Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages in your phone, it might
give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are
going to got here is fresh in the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow
town. It is good thing to have Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages because this
book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you seldom get
what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The
Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want
to miss it? Find this book along with read it from currently!

Melissa Gusman:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you know
that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your own
teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something by book. A substantial number
of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them are these claims Kabbalistic
Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages.

Kenneth Kan:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt that when they get
a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition
of the Hebrew Sages to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is
developing when you just like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to read it and
mingle the idea about book and reading especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide open a book
and examine it. Beside that the book Kabbalistic Astrology: The Sacred Tradition of the Hebrew Sages can



to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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