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This full-color, highly illustrated text for practical and vocational nursing programs includes material for all
courses in LPN/LVN programs. Following the nursing process format, topics covered in this comprehensive
text include: nursing skills, history and nursing organizations, legal and ethical issues, communication,
cultural aspects, human development, health promotion, infection control, homeostasis, health care in the
community, medical-surgical nursing, gerontological nursing,mental health and illness, maternal-child
nursing, and leadership/work transition. Special boxes highlighting information relating to life cycle
considerations, client teaching, home health care, safety, cultural considerations, infection control, and
professional tips are found throughout. Supplements Classroom Manager 0-7668-0828-9 Student Study
Guide 0-7668-0827-0 - 8 1/2" x 11", 320 pages
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Hamby:

The book with title Foundations of Nursing: Caring for the Whole Person has a lot of information that you
can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book exist new information the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of
the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

Lane James:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to
be go through. Foundations of Nursing: Caring for the Whole Person can be your answer since it can be read
by you actually who have those short free time problems.

Debbie Clark:

You may spend your free time to study this book this book. This Foundations of Nursing: Caring for the
Whole Person is simple bringing you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train along with soon. If
you did not include much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make
you easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.

Billie Gould:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. From
the book Foundations of Nursing: Caring for the Whole Person we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to
definitely be creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Simply choose the best
book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book Foundations
of Nursing: Caring for the Whole Person. You can more pleasing than now.
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