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An unforgettable saga of love, loss, and exhilarating change spanning half a century in the lives of a restless
family, from the author of the acclaimed novel The Law of Dreams.
 
The O’Briens is a family story unlike any told before, a tale that pours straight from the heart of a splendid,
tragic, ambitious clan. In Joe O’Brien—grandson of a potato-famine emigrant, and a backwoods boy,
railroad magnate, patriarch, brooding soul—Peter Behrens gives us a fiercely compelling man who
exchanges isolation and poverty in the Canadian wilds for a share in the dazzling riches and consuming
sorrows of the twentieth century.
 
When Joe meets Iseult Wilkins in Venice, California, the story of their courtship—told in Behrens’s
gorgeous, honed style—becomes the first movement in a symphony of the generations. Husband and wife,
brothers, sisters-in-law, children and grandchildren, the O’Briens engage unselfconsciously with their
century, and we experience their times not as historical tableaux but as lives passionately lived. At the heart
of this clan—at the heart of the novel—is mystery and madness grounded in the history of Irish sorrow. The
O’Briens is the story of a man, a marriage, and a family, told with epic precision and wondrous imagination.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Wiggins:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share
the information or their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you reading
a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the personas do it
anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this The O'Briens,
you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire
different ones, make them reading a book.

James Bassler:

The particular book The O'Briens has a lot associated with on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of benefit. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research
before write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after looking over this
book.

Jeff Jones:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this The O'Briens publication written by
well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who all read the
book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still question The O'Briens as good book but not only by the cover but also from
the content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing an
additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you
have to listening to another sixth sense.

Hector Medlin:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find book that
need more time to be examine. The O'Briens can be your answer because it can be read by you actually who
have those short time problems.
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